
March 2020 
SUNDAY MONDAY TUESDAY WEDNESDAY THURSDAY FRIDAY SATURDAY 

1 2 3 4 5 6 7 

       

8 9 10 11 12 13 14 

       

15 16 17 18 19 20 21 

 Write a narrative story 
about a time you made a 
new friend 

Make a map of your 
backyard. Include 4 
symbols, a key and 
compass rose 

Read or write a story 
about Spring 

Write your own story 
problem using tens and 
ones, then solve it! 

Write an informational 
writing about your 
favorite animal.  

 

22 23 24 25 26 27 28 

 Go on Zearn for 20 
minutes. 

Write 5 sentences using 
your spelling words.  

Read two stories to 
someone in your family.  

Draw a picture of a 
turtle and describe how 
it’s shell keeps it safe.  

Make a new book cover 
for one of your favorite 
books. Give it a new title. 

 

29 30 31     

 Write an opinion writing 
about your favorite 
snack with reasons.  

Count a handful of dimes 
and pennies. Separate 
the tens and ones.  

    

       



April 2020 
SUNDAY MONDAY TUESDAY WEDNESDAY THURSDAY FRIDAY SATURDAY 

   1 2 3 4 
   Read an informational 

text about animals. Write 
3 facts you learned.  

Write a poem using 
rhyming words about 
Spring. Draw a picture 
to match.  

Go on Zearn for 20 
minutes.  

 

5 6 7 8 
Ret 

9 10 11 
 Write a “how to” 

writing about how to 
make your favorite 
food.   

Explain to someone in 
your family where we 
are on the map. Use 
Google Earth to help. 

Write to retell a story 
your teacher read in 
your own words. 

Count by 10’s to 120 
forward & backward.  

Zearn for 20 minutes. 

Make a map of your 
kitchen. Use symbols, a 
key and compass rose.  

 

12 13 14 15 16 17 18 
       

19 20 21 22 23 24 25 
       

26 27 28 29 30   
       

       
 


